Name

Eureka Co.
Total

Total
E. R. Linde
Total
Total
Hanson
Aggregates

Total

Total

209
Enterprizes
Total

Total

Locust Ridge

Quarry
Total

Item #1
1000 Tons

1000 Tons 2 RC
Stone

5.30 FOB
$5,300.00

8.30 DEL
$8,300.00

5.00 FOB
$5,000.00

8.50 DEL
$8,500.00

6.00 FOB
$6,000.00
9.75 DEL.
$9,750.00

6.25 FOB
$6,250.00
10.75 DEL

$10,750.00

NO BID

Item #2
1000 Tons

2A Stone
5.30 FOB
$5,300.00
8.30 DEL
$8,300.00

5.00 FOB
$5,000.00

8.50 DEL
$8,500.00

6.00 FOB
$6,000.00
9.75DEL.
$9,750.00

6.25 FOB
$6,250.00
10.75 DEL

$10,750.00

NO BID

POCONO TOWNSHIP MATERIAL BIDS 08/16/2010

Item#3 Item#4 Item #5

1000 Tons 500 Tons 2000 Tons
Superpave 9.5 Superpave 12.5

MM Wearing MM Wearing #3 Stone

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID 7.00 FOB

$14,000.00

10.50DEL

$21,000.00

53.85FOB 51.20 FOB 8.25 FOB

$53,850.00 $25,600.00 $16,500.00

12.00 DEL

$24,000.00

NO BID NO BID 8.10 FOB

$16,200.00

12.60 DEL

$25,200.00

54.50 FOB 55.00 FOB NO BID

$54,500.00 $27,500.00

Item#6
200 Tons

#1 Stone
9.00 FOB
$1,800.00
12.00 DEL
$2,400.00

7.00 FOB
$1,400.00
10.50 DEL
$2,100.00

8.25 FOB
$1,650.00
12.00 DEL
$2,400.00

8.10 FOB
$1,620.00
12.60 DEL
$2,520.00

NO BID

Item #7
200 Tons

R7 Stone
12.00 FOB
$2,400.00

9.00 FOB
$1,800.00
16.00 DEL
$3,200.00

15.00 FOB
$3,000.00
20.00 DEL
$4,000.00

15.50 FOB
$3,100.00
23.50 DEL
$4,700.00

NO BID

Item#8
150 Tons

Cold Patch

Item #9
50 Tons

Permanent

Material Patch Material

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

76.00 FOB 100.00 FOB

$11,400.00

113.00 FOB
$16,950.00

NO BID

$5,000.00
103.75 Del
$5,187.50

113.00
$5,650.00

NO BID

Item #10
1000 Tons

#4 Stone
8.75 FOB
$8,750.00
11.75 DEL
$11,750.00

7.00 FOB
$7,000.00
10.50 DEL

$10,500.00

8.25FOB
$8,250.00
12.00 DEL
$12,000.00

8.10 FOB
$8,100.00
12.60 DEL

$12,600.00

NO BID

Item #11
1000 Tons

Gabion Stone

NO BID

9.00 FOB
$9,000.00
12.50 DEL

$12,500.00

NO BID

11.00 FOB
$11,000.00
15.50 DEL
$15,500.00

NO BID

Item #12
1000 Tons

2B Stone
8.90 FOB
$8,900.00
11.90 DEL
$11,900.00

7.00 FOB
$7,000.00
10.50 DEL

$10,500.00

9.25 FOB
$9,250.00
13.00 DEL

$13,000.00

9.05 FOB
$9,050.00
13.55 DEL

$13,550.00

NO BID



